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SUBJECT: V ARlOUS COMMUNICATIONS 

Approved -"-_____ Disapproved _______ Withdrawn 

The following communications have been received by the Board and recommended action 
thereon is presented. 

From: 

1) Councilmember LaBonge, relative to 

the Griffith Park Vision. 


2) City Clerk, relative to funding for 
Griffith Park. 

3) City Clerk, relative to proposed 
concession agreements with Monterey 
Concessions Group and SRC Event 
Group for the operation of the bar and 
beverage concession at several Depart­
ment of Recreation and Parks facilities. 

4) City Clerk, relative to the 
appointment of Iris Zuniga to the Board 
of Recreation and Park Commissioners. 

5) City Clerk, relative to the 
appointment of Kafi D. Blumenfield to 
the Board of Recreation and Park 
Commissioners. 

Recommendation: 
Note and File. 

Note and File. 

Referred to staff for further processing. 

Note and File. 

Note and File. 
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6) City Clerk, relative to the 
appointment of Misty M. Sanford to the 
Board of Recreation and Park 
Commissioners. 

7) City Clerk, relative to authorization 
to apply for the 2013 Housing-Related 
Parks Program grant funds. 

8) Chief Legislative Analyst, 
forwarding the Legislative Report for the 
weeks ending January 10, and January 
17,2014. 

9) Victor June Ayala, to Jennifer A. 
Rockwell, Sr. Recreation Director I, 
relative to the condition of the fields at 
Guardia Park (EI Sereno North Park). 

10) Tim Donovan, twelve communica­
tions to the California Department of 
Justice, relative to Stoner Skate Park. 

11) Four residents, relative to a 
proposed temporary closure of the 
Hollyridge Trail/Beachwood Drive 
entrance to Griffith Park. 

12) Yolanda Alaniz, relative to the need 
for park space near Oxford Avenue and 
Washington Boulevard. 

13) Rick Selan, nine communications 
relative to the Venice Neighborhood 
Council. 

14) Thomas Carter, relative to truancy 
in Los Angeles schools. 
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Note and File. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Note and File. 

Note and File. 

Note and File. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Note and File. 

Note and File. 
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15) Approximately one hundred ninety­
five additional signers, a continuation of 
Chris Yamashita's petition (via 
Change.org) relative to the State-owned 
Angel's Knoll Park. 

16) Pat Griffith, Mt. Washington 
Preschool and Child Care Centers, Inc., 
relative to the Joy Picus Child Care 
Center. 

17) Rob Campbell, relative to 
conducting a two to three hour weekend 
seminar at each senior centers. 

18) Hai Nguyen, relative to the 
Westchester Tennis Professional 
Concession. 

19) Alessandra Luppi, Enrich LA, 
relative to the Figueroa Bridge. 

20) Bohnie A vanzino, relative to the 
baseball fields at Bishop Canyon in 
Elysian Park. 

21) Charmaine Ferenczi, Paralegal, 
Schreck Rose Dapello & Adams LLP, 
relative to a proposed performance of 
"Wicked" at Stonehurst Recreation 
Center. 
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Note and File. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Note and File. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

Referred to General Manager. 

This report was prepared by Paul Liles, Clerk Typist, Commission Office. 
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